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Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. 

16205 Neabsco Rd. 

Woodbridge, Virginia 22191 

703-221-4915 

RULES AND REQUIREMENTS 

PLEASE FILL OUT AND READ CAREFULLY. THIS DOCUMENT RELATES TO 
YOUR LEGAL RIGHTS. SIGN AT THE BOTTOM. (Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. is 
referred to below as the “Company”). 

Step 1: Participant Information (This information is required. We will never sell or 

give away this information) 

 

First Name: _________________________________________________ 
 
Last Name: _________________________________________________ 


Email: ______________________________________________________ 
 
 
Address: ___________________________________________________ 
      City    State   Zip Code 
Home Phone:  
 
Work Phone: 
 
Cell Phone: 



Step 2: Emergency Contact 

 
Name:______________________________________________________ 
 
Phone:_____________________________________________________ 
 

 
 



 

2 

Step 3: Read and understand risks and our rules.  Your signature at the end of the 

agreement acknowledges your understanding and agreement to the following points. 
 

I acknowledge that I can comfortably float or swim in the water. I understand that 
if I am not comfortable in the water I should not go boating. I understand that this 
is at my discretion, and I assume all risks.  

If the Company takes a picture of me, I authorize the Company to use it in any 
manner it desires.  

If I get hurt, I authorize the Company to call for medical help on my behalf and I 
will pay for my medical fees.  

If I damage the Company’s property, I agree to pay the replacement value.  

I have a basic understanding of maritime rules of the road. I will avoid boat traffic 
and obey all rules. There are significant elements of risk associated with 
watersports and the outdoors. I acknowledge that some of these risks, including 
weather conditions, may cause boating to be difficult. I acknowledge that there is 
a possibility of my boat capsizing. If I see danger I will move away from it and 
alert anyone else I see on the water of its presence.  

I have the authority to sign on the behalf of any persons of minor age whom I 
bring on the water, as I am their parent or legal guardian.  

I understand that jumping and/or swimming from the boats are prohibited.  

I understand that The Company is not responsible for lost, stolen or damaged 
personal items. I understand that I should not bring personal items with me and 
should leave them in a secure location. I understand that the Company is not 
responsible for lost, damaged or stolen items contained in rented Dry Bags. 

I have read, understood and will obey by all safety rules and boundaries.

I certify that I and any minor for whom I am legally responsible who accompanies 
me are physically fit, in good health and can perform any strenuous activity 
required.
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Step 4: Please read and understand the following.  In order to participate, you must 

acknowledge each point by signing at the end of the agreement.  

1. If the boat turns over, and/or I find myself in the water, I will hold on to the boat 
because it floats.  

2. If I hear 3 horn blasts I will immediately return to the Company docks. (not 
applicable to off-site rentals) 

3. I understand that I am responsible to wear my personal flotation device (PFD) 
properly fastened at all times. If I have any questions about the fit of my PFD I 
will ask the Company staff before I participate in any on-the-water-activity.  

4. I understand that I and my child or ward are participating at our own risk. I 
understand that assistance by anyone will be on the basis of the Good Samaritan 
Law.  I further understand that if any Company employee or agent can see that I 
need assistance, he and/or she may come out to assist me but are under no 
obligation to do so.  

5. I understand that participation in the activities associated with Potomac Boat 
Rentals LLC., including kayaking and canoeing and stand up paddle boarding, is 
inherently dangerous and may test a person’s physical and mental limits. Such 
activities have the potential for death, serious injury and property loss to me or 
any minor who accompanies me.  

6. I understand that the use of alcohol, drugs, or intoxicants while participating in 
the activities associated with Potomac Boat Rentals LLC., greatly increases the 
risk to myself and others.  I agree that I am not under the influence of drugs and 
alcohol at the beginning of the activity and that I will not use any mind altering 
substances while participating. 

7. I understand that the Company only authorizes its equipment’s use by 
participants who have completed and signed a waiver and agreed to the terms of 
this agreement.  I represent that I will not allow unauthorized people to use 
Company equipment that is in my possession. 

8. I understand that Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. is a separate entity from Penguin 
Paddling LLC and Hampton’s Landing LC. and that the business being 
conducted is between me and Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. . 

9. In consideration of my participation in the activities I release, discharge and 
waive from all liability any claims or actions that I, my children, ward, heirs, next 
of kin and personal representatives may have now or may have in the future for 
death, disability, personal injury, property damage, property theft or the negligent 
acts or other conduct by Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. and its owners, directors, 
officers, employees, volunteers, representatives, affiliates and agents.  



 

4 

Step 5:  Consent for medical treatment.  I consent to emergency first aid or 

medical treatment which may become necessary during my participation in any activity 
associated with Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. . 

 

Step 6:    Sign stating you understand our agreement 

I have read and understand the above statements and have had time to ask 
questions. I sign this statement voluntarily. My signature below certifies that I 
agree to and understand all rules, responsibilities, information and risks listed 
above and that  Potomac Boat Rentals LLC. is relying upon their truth and 
veracity.  I understand that this document is a legal contract and is, and I intend 
and direct that it is and shall be, binding upon me, my children, wards, heirs, next 
of kin and personal representatives. 

 

Signature (parent/legal guardian):  

__________________________________________________________  
Name         Date 
 

List minor for whom you have the authority to sign  

 

Full Name: ________________________ Age and DOB: _______________ 

 


